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Some students in grades 7-12 are matched
with an adult and participate in the mentor
program. This team journeys together until
the student graduates, serving, learning and
growing together. Mentors meets on the
second Wednesday of the month at 7pm.

Students in grades 7-12 meet 3 times a
month, usually at 7pm to participate in a
variety of activities, including Bible studies,
movie/game nights, all-nighters, retreats,
service projects, and much more. All events
are led by passionate adult leaders. 

Sunday Morning
Students in grades 7-12 meet in room 14 at
9:30am for a time of teaching from a biblical
perspective and fellowship with peers led by
a passionate adult leader.

Sundays
Sunday School - 9:30am
Worship Service - 10:30am

Wednesdays
First Wednesday - 6pm
Pray Now (3rd Wed.) - 7pm

Connect With Us :

Wednesday Night

Mentor Program

Mission Trips
Each summer, every regular attending
student gets an opportunity to participate in
a mission trip. The students will experience
different cultures, settings, people groups,
and ways to share the gospel and serve.
There will be separate trips for junior high
and high school students.


